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SYSTEMAND METHOD FORAFFINITY 
MARKETING TO MOBILE DEVICES 

CROSS REFERENCE TO RELATED 
APPLICATIONS 

This U.S. Continuation patent application claims the ben 
efit of U.S. patent application Ser. No. 1 1/969,585 filed Jan. 4, 
2008, entitled “System And Method For Affinity Marketing 
To Mobile Devices, the entire disclosure of the application 
being considered part of the disclosure of this application, and 
hereby incorporated by reference. 

STATEMENT REGARDING FEDERALLY 
SPONSORED RESEARCH ORDEVELOPMENT 

None. 

BACKGROUND OF THE INVENTION 

1. Technical Field 
This present invention is directed to a method and system 

for providing selected content displays to users of mobile 
electronic devices and more specifically to a method and 
system for broadcasters to provide a marketing portal pre 
sented in the form of displayed customized broadcaster con 
tent. 

2. Discussion 
To improve customer loyalty, retailers have long used 

affinity based marketing programs. As the delivery of infor 
mation becomes more important to consumers, many com 
panies focus on providing or locating content for users 
through the internet. The companies who create content for 
users are generally known as content producers and the com 
panies who deliver or find content from content producers are 
generally known as content providers. As users have become 
more mobile and new technology has been developed, users 
have a greater selection of mediums through which to receive 
their content. As users are becoming more mobile, the impor 
tance of quickly and reliably reaching these users has 
increased. 

To improve customer loyalty many content providers use 
affinity based marketing through the internet. Internet based 
affinity marketing typically uses customizable tools and spe 
cialized content. While internet based affinity marketing is 
widely used, many mobile consumer devices are not readily 
connected to the internet and have not yet developed a system 
or method to provide specialized content or other affinity 
marketing tools directly to the user. For example, radio broad 
casters have long been able to provide simple information to 
radio displays, including Song title, artist, genre, station iden 
tifications and even in some limited contexts simplified ver 
sions of album artwork. Some radio displays include device 
specific displays, but generally broadcasters have not been 
able to provide specific content that includes visually dis 
played advertising, specialized content, and other affinity 
based marketing information and content. Furthermore, 
broadcasters of non-internet provided information have not 
been able to individually provide a displayed look and feel to 
users, such as through broadcaster specific skins. Therefore, 
while broadcasters have long been able to visually and inter 
actively provide specialty content and affinity marketing to 
computers via their websites and specialized content players, 
traditional broadcasters have not been able to provide special 
ized content or other affinity marketing services to users of 
radios, phones with radios, and televisions free from the 
internet as internal access for many mobile devices is very 
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2 
limited. Furthermore, broadcasters have not been able to pro 
videspecialized content and affinity based marketing services 
directly to vehicles. 

Therefore, it is desirable to provide a system and method 
for interactively communicating with mobile systems, and in 
particular with vehicle radios used by various consumers to 
provide affinity based marketing services. 

SUMMARY OF THE INVENTION 

In view of the above, the present invention is directed to a 
method and system for providing selected content displays to 
users of mobile electronic devices and more specifically to a 
method and system for providing a marketing portal for cus 
tomized broadcaster content and affinity marketing content. 

Further scope of applicability of the present invention will 
become apparent from the following detailed description, 
claims, and drawings. However, it should be understood that 
the detailed description and specific examples, while indicat 
ing preferred embodiments of the invention, are given by way 
of illustration only, since various changes and modifications 
within the spirit and scope of the invention will become 
apparent to those skilled in the art. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

The present invention will become more fully understood 
from the detailed description given here below, the appended 
claims, and the accompanying drawings in which: 

FIG. 1 is a schematic view of an exemplary radio; 
FIG. 2 is a schematic view of a second exemplary radio 

display including a touch screen with soft keys: 
FIG. 3 is a schematic view of a third exemplary radio 

display with a broadcaster provided skin; and 
FIG. 4 is a schematic diagram of various inputs and outputs 

for the present invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF THE PREFERRED 
EMBODIMENT 

The present invention is directed to a method and system 
for providing selected content displays to users of mobile 
electronic devices and more specifically to a method and 
system for providing a marketing portal for customized 
broadcaster content and affinity marketing content. 
The system typically includes abroadcast station or signal 

source 100 capable of providing content to mobile devices. 
The broadcast station may be any desirable broadcast system 
but is preferably capable of broadcasting through at least AM, 
FM radio bands, satellite radio, or various TV signals. More 
preferably, the broadcast station is capable of broadcasting 
IBOC or In-Band-On-Channel radio, also known as HD 
Radio to mobile devices such as vehicle radios and mobile 
phones capable of receiving radio signals. The primary pur 
pose of this invention is to provide specialized broadcaster 
content or other affinity based marketing content through 
traditional broadcast mechanisms and not through the inter 
net. Throughout this application, the term “traditional broad 
casters' or “traditional broadcasts' will be used and will refer 
to broadcasts through AM, FM radio bands, various TV sig 
nals, satellite radio broadcasts, and similar signals broadcast 
from a tower to a mobile end user and excludes content 
provided through the internet to the user. More specifically, 
the broadcaster must be capable of providing specialized 
content to many users, without individual interaction with the 
end user upstream to the broadcaster. Traditional broadcast 
systems in this application will broadcast the information 
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directly to the end user or multiple end users without the 
necessity for direct interaction. In comparison, when a user 
obtains content through the internet, the user's actions send a 
signal back to content provider and therefore require some 
uplink connection from the user to the broadcaster which the 
present invention does not need. 

Until recently, traditional broadcasters were limited to pro 
vide data to remote devices such as vehicle radios to using 
RDS, also known as Radio Data System. RDS only allowed 
for very basic text information as RDS does not have the 
bandwidth capacity for significant graphic content, such as 
providing album covers, backgrounds, or detailed skins. In 
comparison, the present invention by using IBOC allows for 
detailed graphical displays by the broadcaster and has a 
greater data capacity for many graphical applications. Infor 
mation provided through RDS typically only included station 
call signs, song titles, artist names, album names and other 
limited textual displays. Any graphical display rules were 
generally chosen by the end user's device. 
A mobile device receives the signals from the broadcaster. 

The display 10 of the mobile device is schematically illus 
trated in FIGS. 1-3 as a vehicle radio, and in particular the 
display screen of a vehicle radio. One skilled in the art would 
recognize the present invention may be used with any mobile 
device capable of receiving the broadcaster's signal and a 
device that does not require communication from the mobile 
device to the broadcaster. One skilled in the art would also 
recognize that the mobile device may include multiple func 
tions, for example receive and send communication as a 
mobile phone, but also include a receiver of traditional broad 
casts that does not require sending of information back to the 
broadcaster or sender of information. The mobile device 
includes a controller 140 which provides an output to the 
display Screen. The output to the display screen may be a 
Video signal or the controller providing graphic information 
to a screen through known method. In this application, the 
term video signal or video output refers broadly to any 
method of a controller providing graphical content to a dis 
play. 

If the mobile device is a vehicle radio, it can be used with 
any radio capable of visually displaying the broadcaster's 
content. The radio may include buttons arranged in any con 
figuration about the display, as illustrated in FIG. 1, or in 
addition to buttons arranged about the display, the display 
may be a touchscreen incorporating soft buttons 310 that may 
change functions depending on the current content display. 
Although not illustrated, the present invention may be incor 
porated into mobile phones that receive traditional broad 
casts, portable TVs and other devices capable of receiving 
traditional broadcasts. For example, if a laptop computer is 
equipped to receive FM radio signals, the computer could be 
configured to receive specialized content from the broad 
caster, without sending any information to the broadcaster. As 
described above, if a computer uses the internet to receive 
data, it must send some information to the provider of the data 
to ensure proper communication, unlike the present inven 
tion. As radio and TV waves are extremely prevalent through 
out the world, it is advantageous to provide a system for 
transferring specialized content, including affinity based con 
tent to an end user when the internet is not available but 
traditional broadcasts are available. 

Although the broadcaster content may be provided through 
traditional radios, additional features may be available to the 
end user of dual tuner mobile devices capable of receiving at 
least two broadcasts simultaneously. For example, on a dual 
tuner radio, the user may listen and receive live content from 
one broadcaster, while additional content, such as a skin for 
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4 
the display, downloads from another broadcaster. Once a skin 
is downloaded the user may be able to use the skin of their 
choice, even though they may be listening to a different 
broadcaster than the broadcaster that provided the skin. Of 
course, a broadcaster may provide rules as part of the content 
download process that prevent Such cross use of skins, such as 
preventing the use of their skin with other broadcaster's pro 
grams and content. 
The mobile device may also capable of allowing the user to 

customize the display. Therefore, if the end user does not like 
the broadcaster provided content, such as a “skin' the broad 
caster uses to display their station, the end user can use a 
standard skin preprogrammed in the radio, or other custom 
ized skins. 
As illustrated in FIG. 4, the mobile device will receive a 

source signal 100. This source signal can be AM or FM Radio, 
Satellite Radio, CD, MP3 or any other type of signal. The 
signal is then processed through a data decoder 50. As is well 
known in the art, the content is provided through the speakers. 
The present invention is directed to the display of the current 
content as well as any specialized content on the display 10 of 
the mobile device. 
The broadcaster or source signal 100 may provide content 

presentation rules 110. The display may have certain limita 
tions, output rules or display rules 120 provided by the mobile 
device manufacturer, or if it is a vehicle radio the vehicle 
manufacturer. If the mobile device is in a vehicle, other 
optional device, system, and vehicle status inputs 130 may 
also be provided. A display controller 140 capable of comb 
ing content presentation rules 110, display rules 120, status 
inputs 130, and if desired userpreferences 150 to provide one 
cohesive visual output on the display 10 is included. Part of 
the controller's duties are to provide text rendering 160, back 
ground graphics rendering 170, other graphics rendering 180 
and animation rendering 190. 
As previously discussed, the source signal 100 may be any 

desirable audio or video signal. However, in the preferred 
embodiment, the mobile device is a device capable of receiv 
ing radio waves from traditional broadcasters, such as AM, 
FM radio waves or satellite radio waves and providing an 
audio output to the user. The source signal 100 in addition to 
providing audio output will provide content presentation 
rules or broadcaster content 110, which may include special 
ized content or affinity marketing content. Abroadcaster may 
also provide content that may be used with other source 
signals, such as an FM radio station providing their listeners 
with a skin to listen not only to their FM broadcast and 
provide selected advertisements but also allow use with other 
Source signals. More specifically, the broadcaster may allow 
use of their specialized content, or provide particular special 
ized content to the user, such that when the user selects other 
Source signals, the broadcaster's content is still used, if the 
user desires to use the content and the broadcaster allows Such 
use. For example, a broadcaster provides a skin for listening 
to the radio, but the skin may convert, as illustrated in FIG.3 
to a broadcaster provided skin for listening to other source 
signals, such as CDs and MP3s. 
The data decoder 50 may be any decoder capable of decod 

ing not only the source signal, but also any visual content 
provided, or any customizable content provided. The data 
decoder may also be capable of decoding content presenta 
tion rules, which may be part of the customizable content. 
The broadcaster or source signal 100 may provide content 

presentation rules 110. The content presentation rules may 
include text locations, fonts, sizes and locations for graphic 
objects. As part of the content presentation rules, the broad 
caster may also provide specified content Such as Song title, 
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artist, genre, album, and other textual and visual content 
related to the audio content being provided. Textual adver 
tisements may also be provided by the broadcaster, to be used 
in one of the exemplary customized content boxes 200. The 
textual information may further include station IDs or names 
300. If graphic objects are provided by the broadcaster, the 
objects are typically in a compressed form and/or are 
described by rendering rules, which minimize the amount of 
content transferred to the mobile device. The graphical data 
may also be used to modify the textual information provided, 
such as how the station identification of the broadcaster 300, 
illustrated in FIG. 1 is displayed in a visual format, other than 
simple text. Graphical information downloaded to the device 
may be a background, a customized skin, album art, other 
content-associated graphics, and any ad-associated graphics 
Such as graphics for content boxes 200. If any animations are 
included. Such as Scrolling or flashing text, these rules for 
animation sequences and the descriptions or data for anima 
tion sequences may also be provided by the broadcaster. 

The mobile device may also include a memory module for 
storing of broadcaster content. In some instances, the broad 
caster may also provide samples of music or a free song that 
may be later saved as an MP3 by the mobile device. For 
example, while the user is listening to one channel of an HD 
radio, the other channel may download an MP3 file having a 
Song or other content for later use by the user. The memory 
module may also be used to store skins and specialized broad 
caster content, so that once the broadcaster content is down 
loaded or affinity marketing content is downloaded to the 
device, the device does not have to re-download the content 
every time the user changes the station. Therefore, the device 
may ignore certain data streams from the broadcaster such as 
an already downloaded skin, and only update advertisement 
and Song/album/artist information in the customized boxes 
300, while the other content remains the same. 
As the present invention may receive data and text without 

interacting upstream with the signal source, and not through 
high speed internet downloads, the content provided by the 
broadcaster is typically simple and is expected to make use of 
known mobile device display rules 120. More specifically, the 
device manufacturer, or vehicle manufacturer, or mobile 
phone service may provide specific display rules 120 and in 
Some embodiments multiple display rules which may be 
selected by the broadcaster. By having the broadcaster use 
many of the display rules 120 provided for by the device 
manufacturer, the broadcaster or signal source 100 does not 
have to provide as much information wirelessly through tra 
ditional broadcast mechanisms to the mobile device. While 
only one set of display rules may be provided, it is expected 
that the display device manufacturers will provide multiple 
optional display rules that allow each broadcaster to select a 
set of display rules and then use those display rules to present 
their specialized content. 

Examples of mobile device display rules 120 include 
required text field(s), rendering priorities, max rendering 
times, display size, minimum and maximum fontsizes, mini 
mum and maximum graphic sizes, resolution of the display, 
colors able to be displayed and any other desirable display 
rules. In some instances, the display rules may also include 
locations required for soft buttons, such as the illustrated 
touch screen buttons 310 in FIGS. 2 and 3. 

In some vehicles, the vehicle manufacturer has tradition 
ally displayed various vehicle data on the display screen. As 
part of the current device and system status 130, the display 
may also provide for vehicle status data and other data that 
may be interesting to the user. For example, the mobile device 
may display the current device and system status, such as the 
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6 
frequency of the radio band, the current mode or signal 
source, such as FM Radio, AM Radio, Satellite Radio, CD, 
MP3 or other. The current device or system status may be 
configured to provide vehicle information relating to tem 
perature of the vehicle, climate system controls, vehicle status 
and other data. 
The user may also provide user preferences 150. The user 

preferences 150 may include brightness of the screen, elimi 
nation of broadcaster skins, the use of a single skin, elimina 
tion of advertising from the display or any other desirable 
preference related to the display 10. 
The display controller 140 then combines all inputs regard 

ing the display to provide an output to the display 10. The 
controller 140 may be configured to give certain preferences 
or priorities to various inputs. For example, the display is 
expected to give priority to necessary display rules 120, then 
to user inputs 150 with broadcaster content and content pre 
sentation rules 110 being last. The display controller then 
outputs a video signal to the display 10, which would include 
text rendering 160, background graphics rendering 170, other 
graphics rendering 180 and animation rendering 190. 

In operation, the mobile device will be manufactured hav 
ing certain embedded display rules 120. These display rules 
120 may include various selectable options and generally 
govern the system functions and capabilities. Upon the user 
selecting a signal source 100. Such as an FM broadcast, the 
broadcaster would be streaming constantly or in intervals 
specialized content 110 to mobile devices capable of receiv 
ing Such content. The mobile device would then use a data 
decoder 50 to determine what content was provided, for 
example, the broadcaster would provide various affinity or 
customized content, which could include display of promo 
tions, advertisements or other information in various test 
boxes 200. For example, the user may have set a preference to 
look for any traffic data regarding a particular highway, and 
the broadcaster may provide textual output regarding traffic 
status of a particular highway, which the device then grabs 
and displays. If desired, the broadcaster can provide as part of 
the content presentation rules certain graphic objects that may 
be customized skins, or graphical advertisements. The 
graphical advertisement data may also include various ani 
mations. 
The controller 140 then takes the content and renders it to 

a display 10 by taking into account various display rules, 120, 
user preferences 150 and broadcaster content 110. By using 
the controller 140 to merge display constraints, such as the 
illustrated display rules 120, with the desired broadcaster 
content 110 into an acceptable video output for the particular 
system, the broadcaster is freed from addressing the con 
straints of various systems, and more particularly broadcast 
ing to the display constraints of a particular radio. Of course, 
a broadcaster may send out multiple content rules, such as 
content rules for each of three different systems from which 
the mobile device may choose the best corresponding content 
rules, based upon its display capabilities. 
The foregoing discussion discloses and describes an exem 

plary embodiment of the present invention. One skilled in the 
art will readily recognize from Such discussion, and from the 
accompanying drawings and claims that various changes, 
modifications and variations can be made therein without 
departing from the true spirit and fair scope of the invention as 
defined by the following claims. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A system for receiving a source signal including audio 

content and graphical broadcaster content and content pre 
sentation rules from a broadcaster, said system comprising: 

a display Screen; 
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a mobile device that is manufactured with embedded dis 
play rules and configured to receive said source signal 
and having said display Screen; and 

a display controller providing a video output to said display 
screen and wherein said mobile device is capable of 5 
receiving radio broadcasts, wherein said mobile device 
receives said audio content and said display controller 
receives said graphical broadcaster content and said con 
tent presentation rules from said source signal without 
interaction from said mobile device to the broadcaster 10 
and wherein said display controller outputs said graphi 
cal broadcaster content to said display screen by com 
bining said content presentation rules and said embed 
ded display rules; 

wherein said graphical broadcaster content includes adver- 15 
tisements, album art, and affinity marketing graphics; 

wherein said content presentation rules includes at least 
one of text locations, fonts, sizes and locations for 
graphical objects and as part of said content presentation 

8 
rules, the broadcaster also provides specified content 
that includes at least one of song title, artist, genre, 
album, textual content related to the audio content being 
provided, and visual content related to the audio content 
being provided; 

wherein said display controller gives preference to said 
mobile device that is manufactured with said embedded 
display rules over said content presentation rules; and 

wherein said source signal include downloadable MP3 
files. 

2. The system of claim 1 wherein said mobile device also 
receives user inputs and preferences and wherein said display 
controller gives preference to said user inputs and preferences 
over said content presentation rules. 

3. The system of claim 1 wherein said display controller 
outputs said graphical objects to at least one customizable 
box on said display screen. 

k k k k k 


